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FACILITATOR TIPS AND TECHNIQUES 
 
Listen deeply.  Hear the words, the tone of voice, the body language, the ambiguities and contradictions.  

Listen for what the other is saying rather than wait for the other to say what you want. 

 

Watch the group dynamics.  Who’s doing the talking, who has checked out?  Where is the eye contact?  

What patterns are forming? 

 
Pay attention to the humor.  Is it healing, healthy and does it bring the group to new perspectives and 

improved communication?  Or does it divide the group, increase the feeling of vulnerability and feel 

competitive cynical or sarcastic? 

 
Ask for clarification.  If what someone says is not clear to you, or could be interpreted in several ways, 

then it is likely others are having difficulty with it too. 

 
Trust the collective wisdom.  Human beings are innately self-organizing.  Given the opportunity and 

some simple guidance they will resolve the issue, find the answer, apply the learning. 

 
Use your “ignorance” to ask the obvious questions.  If you don’t understand a word, phrase, acronym, ask.  

It is likely others may not either. 

 
When presenting information, ask for examples.  This allows you to test comprehension and provides an 

opportunity for clarification. 

 
Become comfortable with silence.  It is a useful tool to give the group time to absorb an idea, introverts to 

formulate their response, and you to collect yourself. 

 
Pay close attention to the questions you ask.  Open-ended, inviting questions will expand group thinking 

and creativity.  Closed-ended questions tend to stop or focus the dialogue.  “Why” questions can be 

threatening if asked before there is a sense of group cohesiveness or security. 

 
Use your body to focus the group’s attention.  Move around but don’t pace.  Position yourself where you 

want the group to focus.  Move to the perimeter if you want participants to engage one another in 

dialogue.  If conflict or tension arises, stand and move toward the center of the group to bring focus to 

you. 

 
Be flexible.  Facilitating is a very fluid process.  Pay close attention to the group and be prepared to 

move with the group’s signals of readiness or resistance. 

 
Take time to work through the resistance.  Simply pushing against it may result in loss of trust in the 

facilitator and your ability to continue effectively facilitating may be greatly diminished. 
 
Adapted from Nancy Tam Davis; Dispute Resolution Center 2013  
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There are a number of ways that the role of facilitator can get out of hand or be used unfairly. Often 
this happens without either the group or the facilitator realizing it. It is your responsibility to prevent 
abuse of your position as a facilitator. Maintaining your integrity is significantly easier if you have 
thought through the following responsibilities. 

CODE OF RESPONSIBILITIES:  ETHICS FOR FACILITATORS 

1. It is not enough that you yourself are striving for equality and cooperation. Most people are 
accustomed to participating in groups where one person acts as a leader and is treated as someone 
important, someone with special power and wisdom. Unless the group understands your role, they 
will probably perceive of you as an authority and allow you to influence them too much. It is 
important for you to demystify your role by explaining exactly what a facilitator does, why they 
do it, and that when you intervene in the group’s process it is not because you dislike or are angry 
with someone, but simply that you are doing your job. This is called the facilitator’s disclaimer, so 
that when you do interrupt someone, you have a reference point to remind people that you 
interrupted in your role as a facilitator. 

2. Even though you explain your role, you may find that people depend on you (“You’re such a good 
facilitator … I know I could never do that.”). They may give some of their power to you and look to 
you to make decisions, define situations, solve problems, etc. This is one of the strongest tests -- 
whether you accept and use this power or reflect back to the group the need to take 
responsibility for its own decisions. The temptation to use the power members give you to fill your 
own needs (increased self-esteem, manipulation of an issue for your own benefit, even the simple 
desire to finish with an issue and move on) will be strong. The fact that the group gave you their 
power is no excuse for you to accept it. 

3. A similar potential for abuse comes from the fact that facilitators perform a subtle, non-directive 
role. The passive, friendly, well-meaning facilitator can manipulate people in ways that an 
aggressive, forceful leader could never get away with. The difference between manipulation and 
dictation may only be a matter of whether or not the group is aware that they are being controlled. 
It is your responsibility not to use the techniques of facilitation to control the group. 

4. There are few external standards or governing bodies that ensure quality for facilitation. There are 
also many types of facilitation. Some people may call themselves a facilitator without any 
experience, skills or understanding of how groups work. (Note: On the job training, lived 
experience, formal and informal education are all valuable forms of skill and knowledge building.) 
Some people may also charge groups high fees and leave them with nothing of value. When 
charging others for facilitation, consider the participants’ ability to pay and your cost/ ability to run 
the group. Be fair and ethical. Additionally, make sure you get fair pay for the value of your work. 

5. Being a facilitator does not make you qualified to be a psychotherapist, either with a group or one 
on-one. Because facilitation involves focusing on human values, emotions, and personal 
experiences, facilitators are often seen as resources for personal psychological challenges. Group 
members sometimes reach out to facilitators, directly or indirectly, with their emotional needs. Be 
clear about your boundaries and what you can and cannot help with. Remember facilitators provide 
support and resources, they do not diagnose or do therapy.  
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6. As a facilitator be wary of any expectations you may have to get your own emotional needs met by 
working with groups. The nature of facilitating fosters mutual growth, however it is important to 
have your own self-care and self-awareness so that group members don’t feel like you are relying 
on them. Often in groups people develop one-sided perceptions of one another, resulting in intense 
interactions. If you as a facilitator become particularly involved with one or more participants, you 
may neglect others, or worse, be seen as an advocate of those you are involved with. This can be 
detrimental to the whole group. If you become more involved with one or more members in your 
group, maintain your neutrality during group meetings and carefully explain the difference in your 
behavior to those who may be expecting you to act the same in group with them as you do outside 
of the group. 

7. It is the facilitator’s responsibility to make sure the group understands what you are doing with 
them: what your purpose is, how your expect to meet their needs, what you can give them and how 
you are going to do that. It is your responsibility to present yourself fairly, to be open to feedback 
from the group (you are there for their benefit), and to consider altering your approach to meet the 
group’s purpose and goals. It’s the group’s right to hold you accountable for what you do with them, 
just as it is your role to ensure that they too take responsibility for their actions in making the group 
a successful experience of everyone. 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

  

 

 

 

 

 

 

Code of Responsibilities: Ethics For Facilitators, July 11, 2011 


